
 

 

*Coast to Coast Legal Aid of South Florida, Inc.:  Angela Fernandez 

Room 4101     Monday – Friday 8:30 -4:30 

Coast to Coast Legal Aid of South Florida’s (CCLA) Family Court Self Advocacy 

Program provides legal information and guidance for divorce, paternity, and other 

family law cases. We meet with each family law pro se litigant to discuss their next 

step in litigation including which forms to file. We also streamline the referral of 

victims of domestic violence to our main office for holistic representation in 

Injunction, family law, and all related civil legal matters. 

Room 4106     Monday – Friday 8:30 -4:30 

Registration for Women in Distress Programs. Court accompaniment, Victim 
Compensation and Relocation Assistance packets. Referrals to community 
resources including Coast to Coast Legal Aid, Women in Distress Injunction for 
Protection Program, Legal Aid, etc. For emergencies, please call the Women in 
Distress 24HR Crisis Hotline at 954-761-1133. 

 



 

Room 5106     Monday – Friday 9:00 -4:30 

South Florida Wellness Network is a peer run organization that embraces recovery 
oriented principles and values. We are here for emotional support and guidance 
and always encourage individuals to play an active role in attaining their goals.                                                                     
We offer assistance in navigating and accessing services through the systems of 
care based on an approach grounded in trust, support, self -determination, choice 
and shared experience. 

Room 5107     Monday – Thursday 10:00 -3:00 

Broward County Court Care Coordination Service program helps individuals and 
families involved with the Broward County Court system identify and access 
resources that can help resolve crisis, health, or human service needs.  
2-1-1 Broward Care Coordinators work collaboratively with clients, connect them 
with general and specialized services in our community, and follow up to ensure 
that clients successfully link with community services.  
 

*Henderson Behavioral Health: Arlene Jones 

Room 5101        Monday – Friday    Temporary Hours 9:00 – 1:00 

Henderson Behavioral Health offers an array of mental health and behavioral 
health services for both youth and adults. Services include: Twenty-four hour a day 
crisis services via mobile crisis team, inpatient crisis stabilization unit, and a 
centralized Receiving Center; Housing Services offering varying degrees of 
supervised and independent living; Conveniently located psychosocial 
rehabilitation and supported employment programs; Outpatient centers for 
children, adult and families; Case Management for all ages; Emergency and 
permanent housing with support services for homeless persons; Youth group 
homes and transitional housing for young adults; Family preservation, reunification 
and community-based services; VICTORY (Veterans in Counseling to Obtain 
Recovery) program offering therapeutic services for military personnel and their 
loved ones; Primary health care integrated into behavioral health care programs; 
Student Counseling.


